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1st Supplemental / Bid Bulletin on the 

 
 

PROCUREMENT OF REMOTE MONITORING AND MANAGEMENT SOFTWARE 
 
 
To all Prospective Bidders: 
 
This shall form an integral part of the Bid documents. 
  

Clarifications:  
QUERIES ANSWERS 

For bidders under Joint Venture, are all parties 
required to submit all eligibility documents? 

Persons/entities forming themselves into a joint 
venture, i.e., a group of two (2) or more 
persons/entities that intend to be jointly and severally 
responsible or liable for a particular contract are 
eligible to participate in this bidding. Provided, 
however, That Filipino ownership or interest of the joint 
venture concerned shall be at least sixty percent 
(60%). For this purpose, Filipino ownership or interest 
shall be based on the contributions of each of the 
members of the joint venture as specified in their JVA. 
 
In case the joint venture is already in existence, a valid 
Joint Venture Agreement (JVA) shall be submitted. In 
the absence of JVA, a duly notarized statements from 
all the potential joint venture partners should be 
included in the bid, stating that they will enter into and 
abide by the provisions of the JVA in the event that the 
bid is successful, provided that the JVA shall be 
submitted before the award of the contract. Failure to 
enter into a joint venture in the event of a contract 
award shall be ground for disqualification. 
 
Further, each party under a Joint Venture shall submit 
a certificate or screenshot of their PhilGEPS 
Registration Number. The Mayor’s/Business Permit, 
Omnibus Sworn Statement, and Secretary’s 
Certificate/Special Power of Attorney (if applicable) 
shall be submitted by the Primary Member who will join 
the bidding.  

 
Items not mentioned above remain the same. 
 
This Supplemental/Bid Bulletin is being issued to clarify/modify/amend the specifications of the requirement 
needed, and not for purposes of delaying the proceedings of RA 9184. 
 
Issued this 11th day of March 2024. 
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                          Chairman, Bids and Awards Committee 
 


